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"Unity is the
challenge for our
society today. If
we do not achieve

a spirit of unity
within our society,
then we shall all

perish separately."
This was the

warning sounded

by Dr. ¥. EltonHendricks, college
president, at the
opening convoca­
tion for the spring
semester.

Dr. Hendricks began his speech by
recalling an incident that his wife Jerry
had experienced while teaching at a
predominantly black "union school"
(grades 1-12) in South Carolina in the late
1960's. At a Thanksgiving Day program,
a black child acting as narrator had said,
"When our forefathers came over on the

Mayflower ... "
He said Mrs. Hendricks knew this

child's ancestors had came to America on

slaveships, not the Mayflower. The
president said his own ancestors came to
Georgia, from a debtor's prison in
England.

"Finally we concluded that it was
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proper for young black children to claim
the Mayflower as part of their tradition,"
said President Hendricks, "only if, as
whites, we are willing to claim the
slaveships as part of our tradition."

Noting that America is made up of
immigrants from many different back­
grounds, Dr. Hendricks compared the
nation to a tossed salad, in which all

ingredients are recognizable but still
contribute to the "richness and fullness of
our common life."

Dr. Hendricks said a liberal arts

education enables people to better
appreciate their roots, as well as other
traditions. He said St. Paul wrote of the

value of diversity in the early church at
Corinth, comparing the Christian church
to a human body, in which each part
needs the other.

The president said he agreed with Plato
that "the best body politic is one where
the entire body of citizens shares the
happiness and suffering of each member."
He said today's single issue political
groups often fail to understand the needs
and interests of others.

Dr. Hendricks said Americans must

look beyond individual differences,
because "unity with diversity is not only a
moral imperative, but also a practical
necessity. "

••• MANY T1iANKS TO T1iESE

VOLUNTEERS FROM T1iE

GRAY'S CREEK

COMMUNITY FOR T1iEIR

HELP IN PREPARING T1iE

LAST Me TOOA Y.

CLOCKWISE, L. TO R.,

ANNIE RUTH MELVIN,

LOIS WELLONS,

AzELENE McARTliUR,

CAROLINE PARSONS,

CAROLINE AVERETTE,

EMILY CLARK, BEULAH
MELVIN.



CAMPUS & COMMUNITY

METHODIST COLLEGE CONTRIBUTES
To DOGWOO'D FESTIVAL

Methodist College will contribute five
events to Fayetteville's 1992 Dogwood
Festival April 3-12.

Art Exhibit

The Honors Art Exhibit, featuring
works by Methodist's senior art majors,
will be held in the Mallett-Rogers House.
Works can be viewed March 28 - April
13 from 1-3 p.m. Monday, Wednesday,
and Friday; 12:30 - 2:30 p.m. Tuesday
and Thursday; and 2-4 p.m. Saturday and
Sunday.

Chekhov Farces

The Monarch Playmakers will present
two one-act farces by Anton Chekhov
April 3-5 in front of the Mallett-Rogers
House on campus.

Performance times are Friday and
Saturday at 8 p.m. and Sunday at 3 p.m.
Admission is $4 for adults and $2 for
children and senior citizens.

Both farces involve "a battle of the
sexes with a Russian flavor." In "The

Bear," the hero and heroine argue over a
debt, challenge each other to a duel, and
fall in love. In "The Marriage Proposal," a
different hero and heroine argue over land
and hunting dogs, nearly come to blows,
and finally fall in love.

Paul Wilson, assistant professor of
theatre and speech, is the director and set
designer. The program is being supported

•••

BIRD-WATCHING IN THE

MONARCH FOREST.

with a Local Government Grant from the

Arts Council of Fayetteville/Cumberland
County and the City of Fayetteville.

Bird Watching
Bird lovers are invited to take a walk in

the Methodist College woodland with Dr.
Erik Bitterbaum, vice president for
academic affairs and resident ornithologist.

The "bird walk" will begin at 8 a.m.
Saturday, April 4 in front of Homer
Administration Building. Bring your field
glasses and enjoy the spring arrival of
warblers, jays, nuthatches and related
birdlife.

Nature Walk
Wild flowers will be the focus of a

guided tour of the Pauline Longest Nature
Trail Saturday, April 4 at 10 a.m.

Dr. Linda Sue Barnes, professor of
biology, will identify numerous wildflow­
ers native to the Cape Fear region. The
tour will begin at the pond adjacent to the
Shelley Baseball Field on campus.
Walkers may drive to the starting point via
the access road behind March F. Riddle
Center.

Theatre Festival

The Methodist College Theatre
Department will present its second annual
"Hail Dionysus!" High School Theatre
Festival Thursday, April 9 in Reeves
Auditorium.
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The purpose of the all-day event is to
celebrate original playwrighting by high
school and college students. Students
from local high schools will present
original scenes or skits and attend
performance and technical workshops
during the day. Methodist's Circuit
Players will perform during a barbecue
supper.

Evening performances in Reeves
Auditorium will showcase high school
actors and three original one-act plays
written and directed by Methodist College
students. Awards will be presented to
outstanding high school performers and to
the Methodist College student whose one­
act play is judged the best.

Morning, afternoon, and evening
performances are free and open to the
public. For a complete schedule of the
day's activities, contact Dr. Jack Peyrouse,
professor of theatre and speech, 630-7104.

WAR
MEMORIAL

Methodist College will dedicate a
War Memorial to its fallen alumni

Wednesday, May 20 at 2 p.m.
The memorial will be placed on

the campus lawn near the flagpole,
facing Homer Administration
Building. A stone marker and
plaque will honor Methodist alumni
who gave their lives in the defense of
freedom.

Dr. John Sill, professor of
sociology at Methodist and an Air
Force chaplain, will speak at the
dedication ceremony. Dignitaries
from Fort Bragg, members of
Methodist's ROTC contingent, and
local veterans have been invited to

participate.
Mr. Bev Pankey, vice president

for development, organized the
drive to raise funds for the project.



CAMPUS & COMMUNITY

SPIRIT PROGRAM BRINGS
TOWN, GOWN TOGETHER

.A. CLARIE WHITE TALKS ABOUT A

FAVORITE CHILDREN'S BOOK.

A United Waygrantof$17,000 made
it possible to expand the program to serve
all students at Pauline Jones (grades 4-6)
who are reading below grade level.

The program's second session, held the
first Tuesday in February, drew 91 parents
to the school cafeteria to learn "What You

Can Do at Home" to improve your child's
reading. For two hours parents heard
presentations from four different educa­
tors and shared practical advice drawn
from personal experience.

Dr. Tony DeLapa showed parents how
to use a daily newspaper, the Fayetteville
Observer- Times, to teach vocabulary, basic
math, and writing.

Ms. Jerch demonstrated the SQ3R
reading method (survey, question, read,
recite, review) using the popular children's
book In the Dark, featuring the Berenstein
Bears. She urged parents to pose ques­
tions when reading picture books to their
children.

Mrs. Clarie White, a parent, urged her

peers to set an example for their children
by reading more at home. She said·
parents should encourage their children to
read aloud at least 15 minutes each day
and should capitalize on the child's special
interests in selecting reading material for
them. She urged parents to monitor what
their children read, discuss what they are
reading with them, and try to tie-in object
lessons in stories with everyday problems.

Mrs. Sally Austin, principal at Pauline
Jones Elementary School, reviewed a copy
of a magazine entitled Highlights for

Children: Reading With a Purpose. All
parents participating in the program
received a free subscription to the maga­
zine, which is filled with articles and
activities for children.

Mrs. Austin concluded her presentation
by distributing contracts to parents, in
which they and their child contracted with
her to set aside 20 minutes each night for
reading .

(Please see, SPIRIT, page 15)

School spirit has taken on new
meaning this year at Pauline Jones
Elementary School in Fayetteville.

SPIRIT - Students and Parents

Involved in Reading Instruction Together
- is a collaborative parent education
program designed to improve the reading
skills of disadvantaged fourth graders.
The program is co-directed by Ms.
Jennifer Jerch, English and education
instructor at Methodist College, and Mrs.
Barbara Rice, a fourth grade teacher at
Pauline Jones.

The five-month program offers parents
monthly workshops and free reading
material for their children. It was made

possible by grants from the Z. Smith
Reynolds Foundation, the United Way of
Cumberland County, Methodist College,
and the Cumberland County Schools.

The proposal for the Reynolds grant
garnered $25,305 to improve the reading
skills of fourth graders; the proposal was
written by school principal Sally Austin
and Methodist College education profes­
sors Dr. Tony DeLapa and Ms. Jennifer
Jerch.

.A. THE PEOPLE BEHIND THE SPIRIT PROGRAM. L. TO R., JENNIFER JERCH, DR. TONY

DELAPA, SALLY AUSTIN, DAISY STEWARD, CLARIE WHITE AND MRS. BARBERA RICE.
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WHAT'S NEW

COMPUTERIZED INDEX MAKES RESEARCH EASIER

PANKEY ASSUMES DEVELOPMENT POST

••• DAVIS LIBRARY - ANDREA STREITENBERGER, A FRESHMAN FROM FAYETTEVILLE,
USES lliE NEW PRO QuEST PERIODICALS INDEX.

Davis Memorial library has acquired a
computerized index for journals and
periodicals which enables students to easily
locate reference sources on almost any
subject.

The Pro-Quest I system from University
Microftlrns consists of a microcomputer,
color monitor, printer, six-disk CD-ROM
player, software program, and two CO­
RaM disks containing periodicals ab­
stracts. It was purchased in December with
funds provided by Friends of Davis
Memorial library.

Contents of 600 journals (magazines,
periodicals) and the last six months of The
New York Times are indexed. About 450

journals are indexed back to 1986; while
the remainder go back to 1990. A new
version is mailed to the library each month.

When a student enters a subject into the
system - "greenhouse effect," for example
- the system reports how many records
contain this phrase. By ordering up a
display of titles and abstracts of articles, a
student can determine which articles would

be most useful for more detailed reading
and research. Students can obtain print­
outs of bibliographic citations or brief
abstracts (summaries) of particular articles.

Davis library currently holds 26 percent
(251 titles) of the journals indexed in the
Pro Quest system. For journals which are
not in the collection, articles may be
requested from another library through
interlibrary loans.

When a demonstration version of the

Pro Quest system was made available to
faculty and students last spring, they were
impressed. Most found it much quicker
and more efficient than the traditional

print indexes such as "Reader's Guide to
Periodicals. "

"Students started to use journals in our
collection that they would not have by
using the printed indexes," noted Susan
Pulsipher, director oflibrary services.
"This is because they would only search
one print index and those are subject­
oriented, or without the abstract they
didn't think the article was worth pursu­
ing."

Mrs. Pulsipher said the new computer­
ized index will be especially helpful to golf
and tennis management students and
students in criminal justice/legal studies,
"as those subjects are not covered much in
our print indexes."

emy. He eamed a bachelor's degree in
business administration and a master's

degree in management from Aquinas
College. He has taught business courses at
Aquinas, Davenport College, Rhode
Island Junior College, and Longwood
College.

"Methodist College is fortunate to
recruit a man like Bev Pankey," said Dr.
Elton Hendricks, college president. "His
enthusiasm for Christian higher education
and his previous success as a fund-raiser
will be invaluable to the college."

Bev Pankey describes college develop­
ment work as "a matter of faith­

persuading people that the college is worth
supporting, and numbers - reaching as
many friends, alumni and foundations as
possible." He said immediate goals at
Methodist will be to expand the donor
base and increase giving by businesses,
friends, and alumni.

"I see a lot of strengths at Methodist, "
said the new vice presiqent. "The faculty
and staff seem to have a genuine interest
in students. Methodist teaches Christian

values and that's extremely important.
There's a good, cooperative spirit here and
a wholesome atmosphere. Methodist
College has accomplished a lot in its first
30 years and already has an excellent
reputation."

Beverly S. Pankey was named the new
vice president for development, effective
January 20.

Mr. Pankey was previously employed as
director of corporate relations at Aquinas
College in Grand Rapids, Michigan. He
succeeds Thomas W. Wtlliams, Jr. who
resigned in December.

Methodist's new fund-raiser directed

an $8 million capital fund campaign for
Aquinas College from 1990-91. He also
taught courses in marketing, strategic
planning, and small business manage­
ment. Mr. Pankey was previously director
of marketing for two Michigan furniture
and office systems manufacturers and
served 21 years as a supply corps officer in
the Navy.

Mr. Pankey holds a B.S. degree in
engineering from the U.S. Naval Acad-
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GIFTS

COMMUNITY LOYALTY CAMPAIGN
TARGETS NEW BUSINESSES, FRIENDS

••• PHYSICAL EDUCA110N STUDENT,
INSTRUCTOR EXAMINE HUMAN ANATOMY

MooEl RECEIVED VIA GRANT.

This year's Community Loyalty
Campaign targeted 2,000 local businesses,
three times more than last year, in an
effort to raise $175,000 in sustaining
funds for the college. By the end of the
first day, the foundation had secured gifts
and pledges of $52,000, approximately
double the amount raised on the same day
last year.

The college cheerleaders and stage band
added pizzazz to this year's breakfast. The
cheerleaders led the volunteers in a cheer

and the stage band, under the direction of
Mike Rogers, serenaded the departing
crowd from the east balcony of the Berns
Student Center.

Charitable Trust in Fayetteville awarded
the college grants for communications
equipment, a kiln for the Art Department,
microscopes for the Biology Department,
a human anatomy model, and a harpsi­
chord.

The Lafayette Society gave the college a
gift toward publication of a new brochure
on the college's Lafayette Collection.

GRANTS AID FIVE DEPARTMENTS

life. He cited two examples of students
who had overcome adversity during their
years at Methodist, had graduated, and
were now major successes, "Your gift is a
gift for eternity," he said.

Kimberly Ratliff, president of the
Student Government Association ex­

pressed thanks to all Foundation mem­
bers, past and present, for creating
Methodist College and making it success­
ful.

Bev Pankey, Methodist's new vice
president for development, read a poem
called "Volunteer Heaven" and urged
campaign workers to help expand
Methodist's donor base in the greater
Fayetteville community.

Methodist College received some major
grants recently.

The Z. Smith Reynolds Foundation
awarded Methodist a grant of $25,305 for
a collaborative parent education program
designed to improve the reading skills of
disadvantaged fourth graders.

The grant will support a five-month
SPIRIT

program
for parents
of under­

achieving
pupils
enrolled at
Pauline

Jones
Elementary
School in

Fayetteville
-->- see
related
feature on

page 4.
The

Florence

Rogers

••• NEW KILN II ART

DePARTMENT WAS MADE

POSSIBLE BY THE FLORENCE

ROGERS CHARITABLE TRUST.

••• DICK PLAYER, CHAIRMAN OF '92
CoMMUNITY LOYALTY CAMPAIGN

The Methodist College Foundation
kicked off its 35th annual Community
Loyalty Campaign Tuesday, February 18
with a breakfast/pep rally.

Richard L. Player, Jr., president of
Player, Inc., set the tone for the event by
urging 100 volunteers to cultivate all
prospective donors, not just the wealthy.

Mr. Pla}'er told the story of a couple
who met with the president of Harvard
University in 1884 to discuss a way to
memorialize their son who had died in

Europe. Treated with disdain, as if they
were incapable of making a significant gift,
the couple subsequently abandoned
Harvard and gave $26 million to endow
Stanford University.

College President Elton Hendricks
said that the challenge now facing
Methodist College is one of great­
ness- how to build its reputation
nationally and internationally. He
said Methodist devotes a larger
percentage of its budget (approxi­
mately 20 percent) to scholarships for
students than any college in the state.
He said the Foundation and those

who donate to the college make it
possible for the college to implement
its stated policy that "no qualified
student shall be denied entry to
Methodist College for financial"reasons.

Vice President for Development
Bill Lowdermilk said Methodist

College is in the business of helping
people realize their full potential in
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CAMF'LJS Nl:..WS

Term I - May 18 - June 5
Term II -June 15 - July 10

Term III -July 13 -August 7
Phone 630-7036 for a schedule.

• STUDENTS CHECK 0l1T THE NEW

SWEATSHIRTS.

SUMMER SCHOOL '92

cranberry, and pink) have
been a big hit with
students. More than a

dozen new shirt designs
have been purchased this
year, most from "N u
Sportswear" and "Gear for
Sports."

Mrs. Sramka said the

store recently ordered a
new line of Champion
sportswear - sweatshirts,
T-shirts, shorts, and warm-up suits.
"Everything we carry is good quality and
stylish," said Mrs. Sramka. "Many items
are also available in children's sizes."

Prices vary, but T-shirts generally go
for $14.95 - $24.95. Alumni, faculty,
and staff receive a 10 percent discount on
anything in the store. The store is open
from 8-4 weekdays. Phone orders are
accepted at (919) 630-7165.

WHAT'S HOT IN THE CAMPUS
BOOKSTORE

Additional floor space, display win­
dows, and new lines of college sportswear
have contributed to record sales for the

Methodist College Bookstore.
Store Manager Burhl Cunningham

reports that sales are running 25 percent
ahead of the same period last year.
Sweatshirts are the biggest sellers in the
soft goods area; more than 800 have been
sold since July 1.

Sales Assistant Mary Sramka says the
hottest item right now is an off-white
"tackle twill" sweatshirt with METHOD­

IST COLLEGE emblazoned in navy and
green plaid, sewn-on letters.

A new style sweatshirt with the college
seal and the word "Alumni" embroidered

on it has proved quite popular with MC
alumni. Another big seller is a navy blue
nylon shell windbreaker with Methodist
College embroidered on the front.

T-shirts with Methodist College spelled
out in floral and paisley patterns (blue,

SENIOR INTERNS AT SMITHSONIAN

Last fall Michael Vaden, a senior
history major form Palatka, Florida,
became the first undergraduate to
complete an internship at the Smithsonian
Institution.

Working in the Smithsonian Archives,
Vaden studied the personal correspon­
dence of Spencer F. Baird, a 19th century
biologist who was secretary of the
Smithsonian from 1878 until his death in

1887. His letters are held by four
different government agencies, including

the Smithsonian, and there are major gaps
in the collections.

In the course of his research, Vaden
discovered a book written by !to, a
Japanese fisheries official, which was sent
to Baird's daughter as a memorial tribute
in 1888. Because Vaden had studied

Japanese, he was able to translate part of
the book. What he learned was that Baird

was revered by the Japanese for his work as
the first U.S. fish commissioner. Baird

was appointed to that post by President
Grant in 1871.

During his four-month internship,
Vaden began work on what will become a
cross-collections and repository guide to
the Baird papers. He worked undeI' Dr.
William A Deiss, the Smithsonian's
Associate Archivist. He also reported to
Dr. Peter Murray, professor of history at
Methodist, who sponsored his internship.

Vaden stayed quite busy. On weekday
evenings he took a geopolitical forecasting

course at Trinity College (Catholic
University); he also took many morning
classes in Japanese at George Washington
University.

The Smithsonian was an awe-inspiring
place to work. "I tried to take in as many
Smithsonian exhibits and programs as
possible," he said, "I would guess I saw 70
percent of what's there."

An unexpected bonus for Vaden was
the opportunity to meet Lisa Benzchauel,
a student at the University of Wisconsin
interning at the Pentagon. Like Vaden,
she had a background in military intelli­
gence (Michael was a Marine for eight
years and a Green Beret for four). Lisa
and Michael will be married this summer.

In fall 1993, Vaden would like to begin
work on a master's in international

relations with an emphasis on Asian
studies. His career goal is to work for the
U.S. government, perhaps in the Foreign
Service.
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ECONOMICS & BUSINESS

JOEL SMITH, NATIONSBANK
EXEC, SAYS ECONOMIC RECOVERY
BEGAN LAST SUMMER

Most economists believe the recession
ended in North Carolina between March

and September of last year.
Joel Smith, president of NationsBank

of South Carolina, made that observation
in his keynote address at Methodist
College's Outlook for 1992 Symposium in
November.

Mr. Smith said America had begun a
"mild" recovery from recession. He also
predicted that President Bush will "push
through some sort of fiscal stimulus," to
ensure his reelection. He was quick to
note that the 1990-91 recession had been

much less severe than 1982; unemploy­
ment of 6.8 percent compared to 10
percent a decade ago and job cuts just over
half of 1982's 3 million.

"Short-term, specifically 1992, our
economists call for GNP growth in the 2.5
percent range," said the banking official.
He said North Carolina fared better than

the nation as a whole during the current
recession and should experience a quicker
recovery.

Smith said America's banks "lack the

mandate to fully participate in the
recovery because of our country's crazy
quilt of banking regulations." He said
Congress had failed to enact a Bush
Administration package of proposals that
would have allowed the banking industry
to "fully compete with its unregulated
competition."

Saying America has had "too many
banks chasing too few good customers,"

Mr. Smith said regional consolidations
and mergers of big banks will likely
continue. He said NCNB's agreement to
merge with C&S/Sovran to form
NationsBank "creates an unprecedented
institution that will cover 10 states and the
District of Columbia;"

Mr. Smith said the Federal Reserve

predicts the number of U.S. banks will
shrink from about 12,500 today to
between 6,000 and 7,000 by the year
2010. He said two types ofinstitutions
will emerge: a handful of truly national
banks (including NationsBank) and
smaller community banks that provide
highly specialized service through a
network of no more than 10 branches.

CENTER FOR ENTREPRENEURSHIP HONORS FOUR

.•• L. TO R., MARY GAY CREECH, JAMES WEEKS, DAVID
MCCUNE AND WALTER CLARK.

- PHOTO BY MAlleUS CASTIIO, FA YETTEVILLE 08SEIIVEII- T_

The Center for Entrepreneurship at
Methodist College honored four persons
for business achievements at last fall's

Outlook for 1992 Symposium.
Walter Clark, founder of Mid-South

Insurance Company, was named Business
Person of the Year for 1991. Mr. Clark

was cited for his success in making Mid­
South a leader in the group accident and
health insurance industry.

The Fayetteville based
firm had premium income
of $67 million in 1990,
and netted $5.06 million
in 1991. In December,
Mid-South moved into a

new corporate headquar­
ters building on Ramsey
Street.

Mr. Clark is currently
chairman of the board at
Mid-South life, and
previously served as
president and treasurer.
He is a graduate of the
Purdue University School
of Health Insurance. He
serves on the boards of

several professional associations and three
local banks. He has been a leader in

business and civic organizations in
Fayetteville and currently serves,as
secretary of the Methodist College Board
of Trustees.

David McCune, founder and president
of Fayetteville Steel/McCune Technology,
was named Entrepreneur of the Year for
1991. The firm which he established in

1974 designs and fabricates a wide variety
of steel products, from automotive
accessories to playground equipment.

His first creation was a rear window
louver for a Datsun 240-Z. McCune

Technology has gross sales of $1.5 million
per year and occupies 44,000 square feet
of manufacturing space in the Cumber­
land Industrial Center.

Mr. McCune is an active member of
Haymount United Methodist Church, the
Gideon West Fayetteville Camp, and the
Fayetteville Rotary Club. He serves on the
Methodist College Board of Visitors and is
chairman of the Cumberland County
Private Industry Council and the
Cumberland County Schools' New
Horizons Program.

Dr. James K. Weeks, dean of the
Joseph M. Bryan School of Business and
Economics at UNC-Greensboro, was
named Economics and Business Alumnus
of 1991.

The 1968 graduate of Methodist
College is considered an authority on
production/operations management. He
has conducted seminars on the subject at

(Please see, CENTER, page 15)
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CAMPUS NEWS

INTERNATIONAL

STUDENTS~ GRADS
GIVE Me NEW STATUS

ATTENTION
EDUCATION
GRADUATES!! !

ApPLICATION FOR MEMBERSHIP
METHODIST COLLEGE TEACHER EDUCATION

ALUMNI ASSOCIATION

Name:

Street A;'d~d~ress=~:------------------Graduation Year:

Your Employer's Name:

Your Employer's Address: _

City: State: Zip: _

Your Business Title: -----.-------------------

The Education Department is pleased
to announce the formation of the Meth­

odist College Teacher Education Alumni
Association.

This association will help promote the
Teacher Education Program at Methodist
College and make a maximum contribu­
tion toward meeting the needs for well­
trained and dedicated teachers.

Membership is open to all persons
graduated and certified from the Method­
ist College Education Department.
Return your membership application
today, and be a part of the future of
quality education at Methodist College
and in the surrounding area.-Jane Cherry

contact the college to give or receive
information about friends in other

countries. In the classified pages of each
MC Today, alumni may read about each
other. Please note in this issue news about
Awwad Alazimi of Kuwait (Class of 1985)
who recently visited the campus.

Anyone who would like more informa­
tion on international students or the

program of the Atlantic Coast Center may
contact Mrs. Jane Cherry, director of the
center. Methodist alumni are invited to
visit with international students on

campus- to truly meet the world at
Methodist College.

Please complete this application and return, along with your check for the
$20.00 annual membership dues to:

Methodist College Teacher Education Alumni Assoc.
c/o Dr. Anthony DeLapa • 5400 Ramsey Street • Fayetteville, North Carolina 28311

Pkas( mak( ch(ckspayabk to TEAA

City: State: Zip: _

Home Phone: <--J Business Phone: <--J _
Social Security No. : _

Marital Status: __ Married __ Single __ Divorced __ Widowed

Is spouse a Methodist College graduate? __ yes no

If yes, please give name and graduation year. _

Methodist College is now a miniature
world map. Forty students from 18
countries now study at the college, and
that number and representation will
continue to grow.

A visitor to the campus may now
browse through Brunei, jaunt around
Japan, idle through Ireland, spring
through Spain, bask in the sun of the
Bahamas, and marvel at Mauritius.
Students are also on the campus from
Bolivia, Canada, the People's Republic of
China, Germany, Haiti, Iceland, Korea,
the Netherlands, Pakistan, Thailand,
England, and Yugoslavia.

For several years now, Methodist
College has featured at its graduation
exercises flags representing the countries of
all international graduates. Each graduate
from a new country presents the flag of his
country upon his graduation. A total of
28 flags were displayed on stage at the last
graduation.

The time has truly come when ours is
an international institution, when one
may meet the world at Methodist College.

For much of its history, Methodist
College has had international involve­
ment. That was formalized in 1989, when
the A'uantic Coast Center for Language
and Culture was established on campus.
With a full-time international students'

advisor and a comprehensive program for
international students, Methodist College
now actively recruits all over the world.

Ie is noteworthy that a number of
international students now present on
campus were referred here by college
alumni. One high school in Japan in
Otsuki City, Yamanashi Prefecture, now
boasts five Methodist College alumni.

Methodist College likes to keep in
touch with its international alumni and to

correspond with them. Methodist alumni
from other countries or from the U.S. may
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COMMENCEMENT

REV. BROWN URGES WINTER GRADUATES

.••• FRANK TAYLOR RECEIVES SAM EDWARDS AWARD.

Winter graduates of Methodist College
were urged to make learning "an adven­
ture for a lifetime" at their commence­
ment December 13.

In an address entitled "Welcome to the

New World," the Reverend Wesley F.
Brown, director of development and
alumni affairs at Duke University Divinity
School, gave 84 graduation seniors "one
final assignment."

Reverend Brown, a 1973 graduate of
Methodist, advised members of the winter

class to: "savor what you have learned,
discover a vocation, take care of yourself,
cultivate faith in God, keep things in
perspective, and be generous."

Dr. M. Elton Hendricks presented
Reverend Brown with a Methodist College
Medallion in recognition of his distin­
guished service as a United Methodist
preacher, teacher, and administrator.

Two ROTC cadets - Charles E.
Jackson II and T. Doniell Garnett- took
the Oath of Allegiance and were commis-

-PHOTO BY BOB PERKINS

sioned lieutenants in the U.S. Army.
Frank Steven Taylor, an honors

graduate in history, received the second
annual Sam Edwards Award, signifying his
selection as the outstanding Evening
College graduate of 1991.

Degrees were awarded to the following
persons:

BACHELOR OF ARTS

Fayetteville: Ricardo B. Barbero, cum
laude, business administration; Pauline M.
Blehi, communications/mass media; Betty
A. Fields, communications; Danny E.
Gould, sociology; Katherine H. Grasso,
summa cum laude, psychology and social
work; Rhonda S. Hall, magna cum laude,
communication/mass. media; Thurston W.
Hicks II, psychology; Jamie L. Papp,
political science; Pamela R. Phillips,
communications.

Neighboring Communities: Nelson
Garcia, Ft. Bragg, Spanish; Catherine M.
Glass, Ft. Bragg, psychology; Michelle M.
Raveneau, Springlake, Spanish .
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Other Areas: Lee R. Pittard III,
Butner, NC, religion; Sheryl D. Quick,
cum laude, Houston, TX, art.

BACHELOR OF SCIENCE

Fayetteville: Tammy J. Alvis, elemen­
tary education; Frankie L. Johnson Atkins,
political science; Michael C. Baush,
psychology; Charles E. Brown, cum laude,
psychology; Donald E. Brown, political
science; Kimberly R. Champion, business
administration; Deborah L. Cooper,
magna cum laude, elementary education;
Sylvia B. Davis, cum laude, sociology;
Ronald Loye Duffer, business administra­
tion; William F. Embree, business
administration; Constance P. Farley, cum
laude, history; Kimberly C. Ferguson,
magna cum laude, elementary education;
Jane A. J. Folkerts, elementary education;
Timothy R. Godwin, business administra­
tion; Charles E. Jackson II, history;
Danette McDuHieJohnson, elementary
education; Charles R. King, business
administration; Mark A. Knight, business
administration; Shan M. Kroger, business
administration; Dagna E. F. Kuehl, cum
laude, mathematics; Michael L. Mansi,

.••• REV. WES BROWN SPEAKS.



COMMENCEMENT

To MAKE LEARNINGALIFETIMEADVENTURE

computer science; Robin M. Mauck,
business administration; Caroline K.
Orama, cum laude, special education;
Barbara J. Overman, business administra­
tion; Joan A. M. Pait, business administra­
tion; Richard L. Player III, business
administration; Timothy D. Price,
business administration; Sarah M. Raynor,
sociology; Willie Ell Rose, sociology;
Celeste L. Rumbaugh, business adminis­
tration; Sam M. Smith, business adminis­
tration; Susanne Stulce, business adminis­
tration; Franki S. Taylor, summa cum
laude, history; Tina M. Trainor, business
administration, computer science and
mathematics; Malarie S. Wade, business
administration; Robin B. Warren, special
education; Keith B. Winter, business
administration.

Neighboring Communities: Tina L.
Adams, Wade, elementary education;
Cheryl T. Bueck, Pope AFB, business
administration and history; T. Doniell
Garnett, Hope Mills, accounting; Brenda
L. Hair, Linden, special education;
Melinda K. Harden, Lumberton, magna
cum laude, theater; Garland W. Jones III,
Sanford, chemistry; Rosa Kelly, Ft. Bragg,
cum laude, biology; Claudia J. Lucas,
Falcon, physical education; Christopher L.
Mace, Sanford, history; Constance M.
Russell, Ft. Bragg, cum laude, biology;
Sheila Stevenson, Vass, business adminis­

tration; Karl J. Strellner, Ft. Bragg,
business administration; Judy L. Walker,
Pembroke, business administration.

Other Areas: William S. Arliss, Clyde,
NY, business administration with a

concentration in professional golf manage­
ment; Robert M. Barnhill Jr., Burgaw,
NC, business administration; Catherine
M. Byrne, Dublin, Ireland, physical
education; Sean G. Edmonds, Winchester,
NC, business administration with a

concentration in professional golf manage­
ment; Roy D. Harrell Jr., Beulaville, NC,
physical education; Jolie L. Kurtz,
Middletown, MD, cum laude, sociology;
Steven P. Mitchell, Lima, OH, cum laude,
business administration with a concentra­

tion in professional golf management;
Michelle L. Naylor, Cary, NC, social work
and sociology; T asha A. Pinson, Raleigh,
NC, cum laude, business administration;
Denise M. Pribis, Jamestown, NY, summa
cum laude, business administration; Eric
S. Sayer, Oley, PA, business administra­
tion with a concentration in professional
golf management; James B. Smith, Chapel
Hill, NC, business administration; Sheila
Stevenson, Vass, NC, business administra­
tion; Alexander E. Sullivan, Ft. Lewis,
WA, business administration; Leigh A.

••• WINTER GRADUATE IS HOODED BY SPONSOR.
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Williford, Smithfield, NC, business
administration.
BACHELOR OF APPLIED SCIENCE

Fayetteville: James H. Buie, associate
degree concentration in civil engineering
technology and architecture; Willie Ell
Rose, associate degree concentration in
criminal justice.

ASSOCIATE OF ARTS
Fayetteville: Donna W. Keen, business

administration; Faron L. Key, general
education; Christine D. Zimmer, business
administration.

Neighboring Areas: William T. Lester,
Ft. Bragg, English.

Other Areas: Sayuri Amano, Japan,
art; Lee R. Pittard III, English and
philosophy, Butner, NC; David S.
Troeter, Riverside, CA, general studies.

-PHOTO BY BOB PERKINS



A FRIEND IN DEED

S.S. DUNN CONTINUES TRADITION OF SERVICE

••• PRESIDENT HENDRICKS, DUNN VISIT IN WORKSHOP.

• PLANTER BY 5.5. DUNN

Methodist College has been the
beneficiary of the generosity of many
people since its inception in 1956.
Among this group is the Dunn family.

The speaker for our first chapel service
was the Reverend Millard C. Dunn, the
Superintendent of the Fayetteville District
of the United Methodist Church. It was
he who established the Lenora Auten and

lloyd Dunn Scholarship Fund in memory
of his parents. He was faithful in his
constant support of this scholarship,
although he had three sons to educate, and
the salary of a district superintendent
would seem to run out before the end of
the month at times.

Mr. Dunn had emphysema and the
warm, humid summers in the four
counties that comprised the Fayetteville
District made it difficult for him to

breathe. Since a great deal of the time of a
District Superintendent is spent in his car
traveling to the churches and visiting the
pastors placed in his care, the lay and
clergy members of the Fayetteville District
took up an offering to put air
conditioning in his car. Mr. Dunn
believed in education to such a

degree that he took the money for
the air conditioner and gave it to
the scholarship at Methodist
College.

Before the goal of $10,000
could be reached, the Reverend
Millard C. Dunn died. The

scholarship was not forgotten however.
His brother, Mr. S. S. Dunn in Charlotte,
took up the gauntlet. Year after year he
has remembered the scholarship fund by
his contributions. On his 80th birthday,
he asked family and friends not to buy
him presents but to write a check payable
to Methodist College for the scholarship
fund.

Mr. S. S. Dunn is now 83 years old
and is retired from Hormel Company, but
he annually contributes to the scholarship
established in memory of his parents. In
order to create more revenue for the

scholarship, he makes whirlees, wheelbar­
row planters and other wood products.
He has become quite well known for his
workmanship. His whirlees were recently
featured on a Charlotte television pro­
gram.

Mr. S. S. Dunn had a difficult time

getting his education. Due to an eye
condition he was not able to graduate
from college, but he knows the value of
higher education.

In a recent visit he offered a little

advice for students he is helping to
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educate:

- Getting an education is of utmost
importance. It is something that no one
can take away from you.

- It is a mistake to let the dollar blind

you in making your vocational decision.
- Stand up for what is right. Don't

compromise.
- Too many people just exist rather

than live.

- Rather than trying to live by your
own ingenuity, let God help you.

In talking with Mr. Dunn, you know
how important this scholarship is to him.
His love for people comes across in a
dynamic way. At the age of 83, he
continues to look for ways to help other
people, and he says that he prays to God
to give him the strength to do the things
he needs to do. Clearly, the building up
of this scholarship is one of the things
which he feels he needs to do.

Methodist College was conceived by,
has been nurtured by, and is supported by
the Dunn family and a host of others who
believe in a value-oriented education.

-Bill Lowdermilk

-PHOTOS BY Bill LOWDERMilK



CAMPUS NEWS

METHODIST COLLEGE CHEERLEADERS
To COMPETE IN NATIONAL CHEERLEADING CHAMPIONSHIP

••• THE METHODIST CollEGE CHEERLEADERS FINISHED SECOND TO

CHRISTOPHER NEWPORT IN THE DIXIE CONFERENCE CHAMPIONSHIP

HELD AT GREENSBORO CollEGE.

The Methodist College cheerleaders
have been invited to compete in the
National Collegiate Cheerleading Cham­
pionships in San Antonio, Texas April 9­
13.

Methodist's cheerleaders were selected

on the basis of a videotape which they
submitted to Universal Cheerleaders

Association for judging. The Methodist
team will compete in Division II against
four other colleges. First, second, and
third place prizes will be awarded in each
division.

A total of 20 collegiate cheerleading
teams will compete in three different
divisions at the UCA Championships.
Five of the 20 teams which qualified are
from North Carolina. N.C. State
University cheerleaders will defend their
national title in Division IA. Teams from

Appalachian State, UNC-Charlotte, and
UNC-Wilmington will compete in
Division 1.

Methodist Cheerleading Coach Greg
Rumsey said the UCA invitation is a great
honor which resulted from a team effort
and "a lot of hard work."

The UCA Championships will be
videotaped by ESPN for rebroadcast in
May.

DAVIDSON ASSISTANT NAMED HEAD FOOTBALL COACH

••• JIM 5VPUlT

James Carroll Sypult, an assistant
football coach at Davidson College, was
named head football coach effective

January 27.
Mr. Sypult inherits a young, NCAA

Division III program which compiled a
record of 2-28 during its first three years.
He replaces John Crea, who was head
coach at Methodist from 1988-91.

A native of Fairmont, West Virginia,
Jim Sypult played football at West
Virginia University, where he earned
bachelor's and master's degrees in physical
education. He has 18 years of college
coaching experience-12 at Davidson, five
at Middle Tennessee State University,
and one at Fairmont State College.

He was defensive coordinator, adminis­
trative assistant, line backer and secondary
coach at Davidson from 1979-88 and in
1990-91. He was head coach of the

Bologna Towers, a professional football

team in Italy, from 1986-89 (two seasons).
"Methodist College is fortunate to

recruit as a coach a man ofJim Sypult's
experience," said Dr. Elton Hendricks,
college president. "His knowledge of
football is excellent. His knowledge of a
Division III program in an academic
environment will also be of value to

Methodist College."
Athletic Director Rita Wiggs said Mr.

Sypult was selected from a pool of 115
applicants. "With his broad knowledge of
North Carolina and his 18 years of college
coaching experience,:' she noted, "he
should be a very effective recrui~r."

Sypult said he regards the head football
post at Methodist as "a great opportunity"
and was impressed to learn that Methodist
is nationally ranked in so many Division
III sports (golf, soccer, baseball). "Why
not football?" he asked.

"Division III is the purest form of
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college foot­
ball," said
Sypult, "because
the students are

not paid
(through
athletic

scholarships) to
play. Academ­
ics comes first at
these schools."

Coach

Sypult said he
intends to build a winning team "that will
be a credit to Methodist College."

"There's great high school football in
the Fayetteville area," said Coach Sypult,
"My approach will be to go after the local
talent and then move out from there. My
first priority on arriving will be to meet
with existing team members and get to
know them."



A STUDENT PROFILE

ADVERSITY HAS MADE HIM STRONGER

DAMIEN: CALL HIM DETERMINEDI

.•• DAMIEN LORDS

"LIFE WITHOUT DREAMS

IS A BROKEN-WINGED

BIRD THAT CANNOT FLY."

-RICHARD WILBUR

Damien Lords, a junior transfer
student at Methodist, is a determined
young man.

He has this dream of becoming a pop
singer/song writer. He's a tenor looking
for an agent. He doesn't read music, but
he's already written and recorded 10
songs.

During spring break, he plans to "make
the rounds" in New York City, visiting
record companies, entertainment lawyers,
and modeling agencies with his tape and
portfolio in hand.
He's appeared in
several1V commer­
cials.

Lords knows it

won't be easy. But
he's already con­
quered more
obstacles than most
people face in a lifetime.

When he was two, his mother was
murdered. His father became an alco­

holic. At age four, he and his brother were
adopted by a Louisiana family. His
adoptive family was poor, but by age 12
he was earning enough mowing lawns to
buy his own clothes.

Lords began lifting weights in junior
high school and became an all-state
wrestler in high school. He also played
football and sang in the high school
chorus.

Then he encountered another setback.

He was kicked off the high school
wrestling team his senior year after
"having words" with the football coach
over use of the school's weight-training
facility.

This was a bitter disappointment. "I
was counting on getting a wrestling
scholarship to go to college," he said.

After graduating from high school,
Lords enlisted in the Army's early-entry
program. He served two years in Missouri
and two years with Fort Bragg's 82nd
Airborne Division. He was a member of

the 82nd's All-American Chorus for 18
months.

Three months after his enlistment was

up, Lords discovered he had Hodgkins
disease or lymphatic cancer. His plans for
a music career had to be shelved. "A lump
appeared on my shoulder and I began
feeling drowsy," he recalls. "They did tests
at the VA Medical Center and determined

I had Hodgkins disease in Stage II-B."
After two and half months at Duke

Medical Center and 18 months of
radiation and chemo­

therapy, Lords' doctors
said the cancer was in
remission. He had

overcome his greatest
obstacle to date.

During his
illness, Lords
spent a lot of

time writing songs and wrote an
autobiographical movie script
entitled, "The American
Dream." He also enrolled at
Fayetteville Technical Commu­
nity College, earning an
associate degree in general
education in 14 months.

Lords won the Mr.

Fayetteville Bodybuilding
Contest in 1990- the same
year he beat cancer. He also
began working as a trainer at
Fitness Plus in Fayetteville.

Last summer, Lords and
three instrumentalists produced
a demo tape of Lords' 10 songs
at a Fayetteville recording
studio. The demo is called
"The First Words."

"Many of my songs are very
personal," admits Lords, "Five •
of the songs on the demo are
ballads." Lords' personal
favorite is, "So Cold in the
Rain", but a panel of Methodist
College students thought

"Somehow," "A Lifetime Guarantee," and
"Take Me Away" were his best efforts.
Lords' music is hard to characterize, but it
is closer to easy listening or country than
rock.

Lords enrolled at Methodist in January,
with plans to major in criminal justice!
legal studies. He has since been recruited
to play for the Monarchs football team
beginning next fall. He's still working on
his movie script and plans to take it along
to New York.

Will "The American Dream" make it
to the silver screen? Will Damien Lords

become a recording star? Stay tuned folks.
This man believes it will happen and he's
willing to work for it.
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MILESTONES

PROFESSIONALLY SPEAKING
Kunio Mitsuma has received his Ph.D.

in mathematics from Penn State.

Lewis Walston has been awarded a

$2000 grant from the Burroughs Welcome
Science Faculty Scholarship Program to aid
in his doctoral studies in mathematics
education at North Carolina State Univer­

sity.

Shivappa Palled attended the AMS and
MAAJoint Mathematics meetings at
Baltimore, Maryland on January 8-11. He
also participated in the following
minicourses at this meeting: Instituting a
Mathematics Placement Program and Why,
When and How to use CAS Calculators in

Calculus and Linear Algebra Instruction.

Dr. Ken Collins, associate professor of
religion and philosophy at Methodist
College, will present a paper on John
Wesley at the Oxford Institute of Method­
ist Studies next summer.

Dr. Collins was invited to present a
paper at the international forum and to
participate in the Wesley Student Working
Group at Somerville College, Oxford
University. His paper is entitled "The
Soteriological (Salvation) Orientation of
John Wesley's Ministry to the Poor."

Methodist baseball coach Tom Austin

delivered a 20-minute presentation entitled
"Preparing Your Pitchers For Your First
Game" January 4 in Dallas, TX.

COLLEGE BOWL TEAM
FROM METHODIST
PERFORMS WELL
IN FIRST OUTING

Methodist's fledging College Bowl
Team performed well in the Region 5
College Bowl Tournament held at
Virginia Tech February 28-29. This is the
first year Methodist has participated in
College Bowl, which emphasizes quick
recall of facts about a broad range of
subjects.

The college's four-member team won
six of 10 games and finished seventh
among the 22 college teams which
competed. Teams from the University of

H~ spoke to about 2,000 high school
and college coaches at the annual meeting
of the American Baseball Coaches
Association.

Coach Austin reviewed the step by step
procedure for training and conditioning a
pitcher to the point where he can safely
pitch an entire ball game. He said
considerable practice is needed before a
pitcher can attain a high enough pitch
count to throw an entire game.

Dr. Sue Kimball, professor of English,
delivered a paper entitled "An Old Pealed
Wall: Congreve's Superannuated Ladies"
to the Southeastern Society of Eighteenth
Century Studies Feb. 28-29 in Winston­
Salem. On March 14, she delivered a
paper entitled "Horton and Eva and
Hosea and Gomer" at the N.C. Women's
Writers' Conference in Winston-Salem.

Dr. Kimball has also been invited to
present a paper about Robert Penn
Warren at the national meeting to the
Modern Language Association in New
York in December.

Peggy Hinson, associate professor of
art at Methodist College, presented an
exhibit of her drawings, paintings, and
mixed media works February 2 - March
13 in the college's Mallett-Rogers House.

The exhibit consisted of drawings,
shadow box constructions, and works that
involve the integration of visual art,

Virginia and N.C. State University
finished first and second respectively.

"Individually and as a team, they
played in top form." said Dr. Wayne
Preslar, team coach. "We were an

unknown going in, but defeated teams
from Davidson, Duke, Wake Forest, Elon,
and Lee College. We lost to the Univer­
sity of Kentucky, UNC-Wilmington,
Vanderbilt, and the College of William
and Mary."

Methodist's College Bowl Team
consists of 10 players selected after trial
games last October. The team which
competed at Virginia'Tech consisted of
Stephen Fann, Martin Brack, Cathy
Griffith, and Ann Morris.

In a mid-February contest, the Elon
Invitational, Methodist defeated the host
team. Methodist's College Bowl contin­
gent will host the Methodist College
Invitational in mid-April.
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kinetics and computer-control. The
retrospective exhibit included works
dating back to 1981.

(SPIRIT, continued from page 4)
The program director particularly likes

the fact that parents have shared ideas in
each session for getting their children
"hooked on books." "Many parents are
lingering after the workshop and are now
taking their children to the public library
for additional books," noted Mrs. Austin.

Mrs. Austin gives much of the credit
for the program's success to Mrs. Daisy
Steward, a parent who works part-time as
school-community coordinator and also
serves as PTA president. Mrs. Steward
was instrumental in persuading parents to
attend the workshops.

Those involved in the SPIRIT program
are convinced it will improve the reading
skills of children whose parents are
participating. At the end of the current
school year parents and educators will
evaluate the SPIRIT program through
questionnaires and interviews. The 1992
California Achievemen t Test scores of

students whose parents have participated
in the program will be analyzed to
determine if the project has made a
difference in reading performance.

The SPIRIT program represents the
third collaborative effort between Method­
ist College and Pauline Jones Elementary
School. Last year, Dr. DeLap a conducted
an inservice reading workshop for Pauline
Jones teachers. Last summer, Dr. DeLapa
and colleagues offered a summer reading
camp at the school for incoming fourth
graders.

(CENTER, continued from page 8)
more than 30 universities and for major
American firms such as IBM, General
Electric, Ciba-Geigy, and Dow Chemical.

Dr. Weeks said he appreciated the
honor and the good foundation he
received at Methodist.

Mary Gay Creech, a senior business
administration and economics major from
Linden, NC, received the Wall Street
Journal Award.

A 1988 graduate of Pine Forest High
School, she is an honors student at
Methodist. Dr. Erik Bitterbaum, vice
president for academic affairs, said the
business faculty selected Miss Creech for
the award because of her outstanding
"organizational skills, communication
skills, and leadership ability."



ALUMNI NEWS

ALUMNI BOARD LAUNCHES NEW PROJECTS

••• GENE CLAYTON BRIEFS ALUMNI DIRECTORS ON THE

COLLEGE'S FINANCIAL SrrUATION. -PHOTO BY CAROLINE PARSONS

help, and guarantee it will be fun!
Homecoming 1992 is on the calendar

for October 17. Your Alumni Homecom­

ing Committee has already had its first
planning meeting with the Student
Homecoming Committee, and we are
working on a super special weekend for
you this year. We plan to add some new
events, like an alumni-student joint
cookout just before the game, complete
with bluegrass band!

Although we have some great ideas, we
need more ... and would like to hear what

you want to see on the Homecoming
Weekend Schedule. If you have an
opinion whether the main alumni party
should be on campus or off, please let us
know! Would you like more baby-sitter
time available this year? If there are some
classmates you'd especially like to see, we
are making addresses available ahead of
time so that you can make plans for a
great "coming home" to Methodist in the
fall.

The Alumni Association sponsored an
Alumni Basketball game Saturday,
February 22. Gene Clayton and Mason
Sykes coached, with Mason's team, amid
crys for "Oxygen ...where's the oxygen?"
bringing in the winning score-30-20.

Alumni who came back to play
included Howard Hudson '69, Rick
Merrill '72, Gary Porter '78, Barbara Buie,
Gerald Pone, and Mark Lange '81, Steve
Flowers and Al Carroll '83, Vernon
Livingston '84, Roger Pait '85, Mark
Forbes '87, Darrell Bock '88, Jaime Rosa,
Glenn Gaines, Krebs Corey, and Mitch
Adams '89, Greg Dirks '90, and Bryan
Cole '91. After the game, a reception was
held in the Riddle Board Room for

alumni, their family and friends.
Many thanks to Roger Pait, Janet

Mullen, and Larry Philpott for the hours
upon hours they have spent working out a
1992 Strategic Plan for the Alumni
Association. The plan includes a well­
thought-out agenda of events for 1992.
The new committee structure seeks to give
alumni greater opportunity to get involved

with Methodist College again.
The next event coming up is the May

17 graduation. An alumni committee is
taking a look at changing the reception
our association hosts for graduates.
Currently, we serve refresh-
ments immediately after the
graduation ceremony, and do
not have an opportunity to
meet the graduates and
welcome them into the
Association.

The committee will be

considering alternatives such
as an evening reception
before graduation. If you
have some creative ideas, or
some time to help make this
event a success, please call
630-7170 or 630-7167 to
sign up. We really need your

CoACH CLAYTON'S ~
TEAM TAKES A TIME­

OUT.
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-Caroline Parsons
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ALUMNI NEWS

••• GOLFER SAMMY

HUDSON, A FRESHMAN

FROM GARNER,
CONGRATULATES HIS

'OlD MAN' (HOWARD

HUDSON '69) FOR
SURVIVING THE ALUMNI

BASKETBALL GAME.

A CoACH MASON SYKES

PLOTS STRATEGY.

~ THE ALUMNI

BASKETBALL GAME WAS

SHORT, BUT INTENSE.

LETTER FROM THE
MCAA PRESIDENT
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SPORTS

LADY MONARCHS CAPTURE DIXIE CROWN

to injuries was a concern for Coach WIggS,
but her team responded each time with
solid performances off the bench. Prob­
ably the most crucial factor in the success
of this team, in comparison to other
seasons, was depth. Different players
continued to step in and pick up the slack.

Methodist opened the season with six
consecutive victories and went into the

holidays undefeated. After the holiday
break, the team came back a little flat but
had two more victories until they were

defeated by Greens­
boro College at home.
Five of the six losses

carne during the
month ofJanuary.

The second

match-up against
Greensboro is the

game that Coach
Wiggs views as the
turning point of the
season. After the
Greensboro loss, the
Lady Monarchs made
mental adjustments
and realized that

playing hard for the
entire 40 minutes of

the game produces
victories. Methodist
won 11 of their final

12 games, with the
only loss being to
Christopher Newport
College 93-92, a team
ranked third in the

South region poll.
Several individuals had remarkable

seasons for the Lady Monarchs. Daphne
Akridge, a junior form Bassett, VA was the
first Methodist player ever chosen to the
First Team All-Conference squad.
Novella McMillan, a freshman from
Fayetteville, was not only the first
Methodist player picked as the conference
tournament Most Valuable Player, but
also the first freshman to ever receive the
award. Joining McMillan on that All­
Tournament team was Roxanne

Cannaday, a sophomore from Fuquay­
Varina, and Angie Gamer, a sophomore
from Angier.

away with a 99-75 victory.
Next carne Ferrum College in the

championship game. Both teams
struggled offensively throughout the first
half of play, each shooting only 31% from
the floor. The game remained tight
throughout the second half, until Method­
ist rallied during the final ten minutes to
produce an 82-66 victory.

An overall team effort allowed this

Methodist squad to win the conference
tournament championship. Several
players contributed throughout the season
to give the team a balanced scoring attack
in each game. The loss of key players due

received the higher seed going into the
tournament. Playing the first round of the
tournament against Averett on Tuesday,
February 25, Methodist dominated play
both offensively and defensively to claim a
79-27 victory. This win advanced the
team to second round action against
Greensboro College. The Lady Monarchs
played the best half of basketball they had
played all season, taking a 51-28 lead into
the half. Methodist continued their

strong play in the second half, walking

••• DIXIE TOURNAMENT CHAMPIONS: MEMBERS OF WOMEN'S BASKETBALL TEAM CELEBRATE

VICTORY OVER FERRUM AT GREENSBORO COLLEGE.

The Lady Monarchs started the season
with the motto "In the Market for a

Championship!" With solid performances
from the returning players and a talented
crew of newcomers, 6th year Coach Rita
Wiggs and the 1991-92 Lady Monarchs
attained the pot of gold at the end of the
rainbow by winning the 1992 Dixie
Intercollegiate Athletic Conference
Tournament title.

The Lady Monarchs took the DIAC
tournament championship in dramatic
fashion with convinc-

ing wins over Averett,
Greensboro and
Ferrum. A Methodist
women's basketball
team had never

advanced beyond the
first round of the
tournament.

The team played
impressive basketball
throughout the final
weeks of regular
season play and
maintained that same

level of intensity
throughout the
tournament. Playing
a fast-paced transition
game, this team style
of basketball was

exciting for the
players, coach and
fans.

For the first time
in Methodist women's

basketball history, a
team recorded more than 20 wins in a

season, placed three players on the Dixie
All-Tournament team, placed one player
on the First Team All-Conference squad,
and had a player receive Most Valuable
Player in the tournament. It was a
remarkable feat for a young team that
started two freshmen, two sophomores
and one junior.

Methodist finished the regular season
with a an overall record of 22-6 and a 6-4
record in the conference. The 6-4 record

placed the Lady Monarchs in a tie with
Ferrum for third place, but because of
head-to-head competition Methodist

APRIL 1992: Me TODAY 18



SPORTS

COACH AUSTIN LIKES PROSPECTS BASEBALL
REMAINING SCHEDULE

*Home Games:

Shelley Field
Alumni Game:

March 28

"Senior Day: May 2
#Dixie Conrerence

Games
Head Coach:
Tom Austin
Assistant Coach:

Sandy Davis

The key returner
from a year ago is
Melissa Furr. Furr

plays with great intensity
on both offense and

defense. The Lady
Monarchs expect great
things from this player, who
was selected to the first team

All-Region.
The 1992 team will be

without Anne Ulleman, last year's
team MVP and 2nd team All-Region
selection, due to a ~ee injury. Ulleman
will be missed because of her ve~atility
and her ability to play well under pressure.

With the return of these experienced
players, along with the addition of several
newcomers, this team could produce
another exciting season for the players,
coach and fans.

- Sylvia Williams

APRIL 1992: Me TODAY 19

The 1992 Lady Monarch softball team
has more overall talent than last year's
championship team.

Becky Younger returns to pitch for
second year coach Karen Smith. Becky
was a first team All-Conference selection
last season in the field and a second team

selection on the mound. Her experience
and ability to maintain control and keep a
level head will be important this season.
She will also playa big role for the Lady
Monarchs' offensive threat. She has

excellent speed on the bases and will be
given the go-ahead on steals.

Linder Smith, a senior from

Fayetteville, returns to play shortstop. She
will be counted on for her ability to
motivate and lead the team emotionally.
With excellent power at the plate, she will
be hitting in the clean-up spot. Smith was
a second team All-Conference selection
and a first team All-Tournament selection.

The Methodist College baseball team freshman, will play shortstop, while ChrisApr. 1 Savannah College3:00
has built a reputation for being one of the

Horton, another freshman, will start atSavannah, GA
best in NCAA Division III. This season

third base. Andy Norton and Herman*#Apr. 4 NC Wesleyan12:00
the Monarchs are looking forward to

Pegram will split time behind the plate.*#Apr. 5 NC Wesleyan2:00
building on that reputation.

Starting pitchers include MattApr. 7 Campbell3:00
Head Coach Tom Austin, in his 13th

Boucher, Mike Rohr and Brian Forel. AllBuies Creek, NC
season, is counting on a talented freshman

three will see lots of action on the mound# Apr. 11 Christopher Newport12:00
class and the return of several key players

for the Monarchs. Middle relief pitchersNewport News, VA
from last year's squad to improve on last

are Ricky Young, Todd Pope, Derek# Apr. 12 Christopher Newport12:00
year's 31-16 record.

Covell and Steve Getz. Short reliever willNewport News, VA
Defensively, the Monarchs return an

be Patrick Fachet.Apr. 14 Pembroke State7:00
outfield packed with experience. Joe

Overall, this team will have an abovePembroke, NC
Myrtle, a third team All-America selection

average outfield and an infield that must# Apr. 17 Ferrum3:00
last season, returns at left field. Brandon

mature quickly. The pitching staff is veryFerrum, VA
Bridges, a second team All-South selec-

capable and should keep the team in most# Apr. 18 Ferrum12:00
tion, will provide quickness in center field

games. Ferrum, VA
and Trey Bostic returns to right field after

The schedule is one of the toughestApr. 22 Apprentice School3:00
sitting out last season with a knee injury.

ever played by a Methodist team. TheNewport News, VA
Bostic has good offensive power as well.

team will take the field against 13Apr. 23 Elizabeth City State2:00
The infield, while young, shows great

scholarship schools and eight teams rankedElizabeth City, NC
potential. Greg Cox is the only experi-

in the top 20 in the NCAA Division IIIApr. 25 St. Andrews1:00
enced player returning, playing first base.

poll. Coach Austin said he was "veryLaurinburg, NC
Cox is a solid player with great defensive

pleased with the attitude early on of this*Apr. 27 Pembroke State3:00
capabilities.

team and their push to work hard inApr. 30 Mt. Olive3:00
Mackie Register and Mike Williams are

practice." Coach Austin has amassed 388Mt. Olive, NC
competing for second base honors.

wins at the helm of the Monarch baseball*" May 2 St. Andrews1:00
Register is making a transition from right

program.May 4 Mary Washington1:00
field to ,the infield. Mark Roncace, a

-Sylvia Williams--Fredricksburg, VA

WILL CHAMPS REPEAT?



SPORTS

-Sylvia Williams

Haile, a junior from Webster, NY, won
tryouts in the fall and played in all three
fall events. With a little more experience,
he should playa key role this season.

A talented group of freshman highlight
the list of newcomers. Sammy Hudson
from Garner, NC, Ryan Jenkins from
Colonial Heights, VA and Jim Nickerson
from Augusta, ME are all excellent players.
Coach Conley has very high expectations
for all three players.

This team's goal is to defend both its
national championship and conference
titles. Other goals are to beat all Division
III competition and as many NAJA and
Division I and II teams as possible. Since
1980, the Monarch golf team has pro­
duced 29 All-Americans, six Academic All·
Americans and in the last five years two
national champions.

potential for an outstanding season; both
were named to the Indoor All-Conference
team.

Jason Leinheiser returns, after sitting
out last season, to participate in the high
jump. His experience in this event should
be a valuable asset to the team.

Jay Haley tops the list of newcomers.
Haley is very quick and should be very
competitive in the sprinting events.
Another newcomer who should contribute

immediately will be Steven Allen. Allen
participates in the high jump and the
triple jump.

Methodist's defending NCAA Division
III championship golf team returns only
two players from last year's team­
Captains Rob Pilewski and Billy Ander­
son. Fifth year coach Steve Conley will be
relying heavily on these exceptional
players.

Pilewski is a three-time all-America

selection and was the national champion
in 1991. His leadership and experience
will playa key role on this year's team.

Anderson was a member of the

National Championship team last season
and was selected to the All-Conference
team.

Newcomers include Dave Jukes, a
sophomore form Scarborough, Ontario,
who was aggressively recruited in high
school. He is a little older than most of

the other players and his maturity will be
valuable throughout the season. ,Eric

TRACK AND FIELD
TEAM SHOWS PROMISE

The 1992 track and field team is an

inexperienced group with lots of potential.
John Keady is coaching, with assistance
from Brian Cole. What began as a team
of nine students grew to 23 after the
second week of practice.

Two participants with the ability to
qualify to the NCAA Division III meet are
Tim Shaw and Brian Shuren (pictured at
left). Shaw throws the shot put and •
Shuren participates in the pole vault.

Participating in the steeplechase, Brett
Dietrich returns to give experience and
team leadership. Sprinters Jamelle Ushery
and James McMillan show lots of

·GOLF TEAM SEEKS
THIRD NATIONAL TITLE

•
a;;'"

April (S),6, 7- Erno!)' Spring
Invitation21, Roy21 Wes Count!)'
Club, Chestnut Mountain, GA

April OS), 16, 17- Dixie Intercolle­
giate Athletic Conf., Waterfront
Golf Club, Smith Mountain Lake,
VA

May 07-18), 19-22- NCAA Division
Ul, Wooster Count!)' Club,
wooster,OH

() Denotes Practice Rounds
Head Coach: Steve Conley

Assistant Coach: Darrell Bock
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WOMEN'S TENNIS PREVIEW

MEN'S BASKETBALL
POST SEASON REPORT

The Methodist College men's
basketball team struggled through a
disappointing season. The Monarchs
dropped their first round Dixie
Intercollegiate Conference tournament
game against Averett College 77-75,
ending the season with an overall
record of8-18.

Erick Hunt led Monarch scoring
against the Cougars with 23 points.
James Wear added 15 points, while
Randy Martin and Marc Malone each
contributed 10 points. With two
seconds remaining, Methodist put the
Cougars on the line for a two-shot foul
and Averett sank both free throws to

put Methodist at the losing end.
James Wear, a senior from

Fayetteville, was named to the Second
Team All-Conference squad for the
second consecutive year. Wear
averaged 18.6 points per game. Senior
Erick Hunt averaged 15.2 points per
game along with 4.5 assists. Randy
Martin played the post well this season
averaging 7.4 rebounds per outing and
13.5 points per game. Jason Leinheiser
led the team in assists, averaging 6.5
per contest.
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-Sylvia Williams

Conference Championship the past three
years. Their experience, coupled with
their leadership ability, will greatly benefit
the 1992 squad.

The team faces a tough schedule which
includes defending NCAA Division III
champion Mary Washington and Division
I foe Old Dominion. With solid play
from the veterans and modest contribu­

tions from the younger players, this team
should be very competitive on the national
level.

Kenyon, Carleton, Dennison and Averett,
along with Division I UN C-Wilmington
and Old Dominion University. The team
also travels to Atlanta, GA for the Emory
Invitational Division III Tournament.

While this year's 'schedule is ~e
toughest ever, the team is loaded with
talent and is expected to do well against
even the toughest of opponents.

-Sylvia Williams

The 1992 Monarch tennis team returns

a talented crew of experienced players
from last year's conference championship
squad. Going into the spring season, the
team is ranked 18th in the nation. Chip
and Chris Collins are ranked 18th and

48th respectively in singles and are ranked
25th as a doubles team.

Several key teams highlight this year's
schedule, such as Division III powerhouses

The Lady Monarch tennis team is
loaded with experienced players.

Dorian Droege, a senior from
Clermont, FL, returns for her last season.
Droege is a two-time national tournament
competitor, is undefeated in conference
play, and was named the team's Most
Valuable Player last season. She ended last
year ranked 22nd in the nation.

Also returning for their senior seasons
are Laurie Brucker and Amanda Cook.
These individuals have never lost a
conference match and have won the Dixie

MEN RANKED 18TH

••• WOMEN'S TENNIS TEAM



ALUMNI NEWS

(Please include Name and Class Year)

WHAT'S NEW WITH YOU?
College faculty, administration, and alumni enjoy reading about MC alumni in the
"Classified" pages of METHODIST COLLEGE TODAY. If you would like to share
some good news (marriage, births, promotion, civic or professional honor) please return
this form.

CLASS OF 1965
Walter R. Turner, and his wife Pamela have

completed renovation of their home in
Wadesboro, NC, which was built in 1900. They
have also enjoyed befriending Methodist's
students from China.

CLASS OF 1966
James M. Link was selected for promotion to

brigadier general after his return from Desert
Storm where he commanded 6500 soldiers of the

16th Corps Support Group. Gen. Link is
currently deputy commanding general of the
U.S. Army Missile Command at Redstone
Arsenal, AL.

CLASS OF 1968
Dr. James K. Weeks was elected to First Union

Bank's (Greensboro branch) board of directors,
January 6,1992. Dr. Weeks is dean of the Btyan
School of Business and Economics at UNC
Greensboro.

We extend our sympathies to Linda Shafer, a teacher
at Methodist College, whose mother died
recently.

CLASS OF 1969
Jim Darden, chairman of the horticulture technology

program at Sampson Community College, has
been named a finalist in the 1991 State Board of

Community Colleges/First Union Foundation
Excellence in Teaching Award, the highest honor
given within the state's 58-member community
college system.

CLASS OF 1970
Mary Nell Darden, a first grade teacher at Kerr

Elementaty School in Ointon, was named an
"Outstanding Elementary Mathematics Teacher"
by the N.C. Council of Teachers of Mathemat­
ics. She was one of 130 teachers honored.

Michael Teague received his Ph.D. in psychology
from NCSU. He recently helped author the first
national crime prevention policy. He is a Violent
Crimes Specialist with the N.c. Department of
Crime Control in Raleigh.

Sue J. Smith and her husband Len celebrated their

17th wedding anniversary in Jan. Sue spent 8
months on active duty when she was recalled for
Operation Desert Shield/Desert Storm. She
setved as a Crisis Action Team Leader at Militaty
Sealift Command HQin Washington, DC.

We extend our sympathies to the family ofJerry
Autin following his death. Jerty died on July 22,
1991 of a Cerebral Hemorrhage at the age of 43.
He was the Director of Technical Labs for

General Mills in Minneapolis.

CLASS OF 1971

ALUMNI NEWS

CLASS OF 1972
We extend our sympathies to RobertJ. Reynolds

whose father died in December.

CLASS OF 1975
Donna Beasley Bleser and her husband Donald

Bleser announced the birth of a daughter,
Dorothy Louise Bleser June 27,1991.

Faith Finch Tannenbaum and her husband Michael

are living in Frankfurt, Germany. Her husband
Michael works for the 205th Militaty Intelligence
Brigade. Faith teaches first grade for Rhein Main
Air Base. Their new addition to the family,
Caleb, is 18 months old.

CLASS OF 1976
David Foster has been promoted to general manager

and will oversee both offices of Cellular One in

Fayetteville.

CLASS OF 1981
Sybil Porter McMillan married Brad Bolt May 19,

1991. Sybil received her master's degree in
information systems at Virginia Commonwealth
University and currently works as a production
control technician at Sorran Bank.

CLASS OF 1982
Susan L Burge •• was elecred to the executive staff,

women's division of the General Board of Global

Ministries for the United Methodist Church,

Sept. 27, 1991. Susan is assigned to the San
Francisco Region which covers the Missionaty
Annual Conferences for the west coast.

Mouzettll Zumwalt-Weathen is working for Bristol­
Myers Squibb selling cardiovascular products.

CLASS OF 1983
Marilyn Richmond returned to the workforce after a

two year hiatus during which she gave birth to a
son, Alvorn. Marilyn is currently an Addiction
Therapist at the VA Medical Center in
Fayetteville. Marilyn and her husband Richie are
also the proud parents of eight-year-old Traci.

Linda Trudeau Wise is currently the music specialist
at Eastover-Central and). W. Seabrook
Elementaty schools. She is an active member in
the Fayetteville Community Church Choir.
Linda is married to Gil Wise and has one son,

Joel Aaron, with another child on the way.

CLASS OF 1984
Robert L Larsen graduated with a masters of arts

degree from Jacksonville State University, AL on
Dec. 20,1991. Robert is the commander of the

14th Army Band, Ft. McClellan, AL The 14th
Army Band was the recipient of the prestigious
five star award for the 1991 Parade of American

Music. The band has performed for President
Bush and has become known as the "Militaty
Showband of the South. "

CLASS OF 1985
Awwad Alazimi a business alum from Rumaithya,

Kuwait visited Methodist College Feb. 26. His
daughter Miriam came with him for his visit.
Alazimi reports that his countty is slowly
returning to normal. He is now working for the
Civilian Air Setvice of Kuwait. He remembers his

days here at Methodist and the friends he made
here with much pleasure. He expressed his deep
gratitude for the role America, and specifically
the troops at Fort Bragg, played in the liberation
of his countty.

We extend our sympathies to the family ofJames T.
Gwyn who passed away Nov. 29,1991 from
cancer. Jim was a foreign language teacher in the
Houston, Texas inner school system for the past
11 years after returning from Berlin, Germany
where he was stationed in the US Army as a
translator. He is sutvived by his brother, Stephen,
and two sisters, Nancy and Linda.

Michael J. Alloway has been elected brokerage officer
at Wachovia Bank of North Carolina, N.A in
Winston-Salem. Michael is a stock broker in the

Brokerage Group.

Change of Address

Name Class _•

New Address _

Effective Date Phone _

Send your news or change of address to: Alumni Office.
Methodist College, 5400 Ramsey St., Fayetteville, NC 28311
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ALUMNI NI::wS

ALUMNUS FILES SUIT

LOOKING FOR A JOB?

It's Allin The Cards!

the plaintiffs
appeared at the
Alumni Party
October 12, assum­
ing that Mrs.
Palumbo had done

'her advance work and
would be there/with

many other MC
alums' especially
members of the AJOHN BROWN
reunion classes of '66

and '71. They described the turnout as
"woefully inadequate. "

Citing breach of implied contract and
negligent infliction of emotional distress,
the suit asks for $40,000 in damages OR
that the defendant take an oath to begin
work immediately coordinating the 1992
Methodist College Homecoming Reunion
with members of the Classes of 1966 and
1971.

When contacted by phone and asked
about the suit, Joanna said, "I faxed a copy
back to John the day I received it saying
'Work has already begun. Please drop the
suit.'" In short, Mrs. Palumbo swears she
will be back this fall!

Alumni!!! Would you be willing to
help new Methodist graduates find

jobs? If so, please send in your
business card so we can create a

bulletin board on campus for
seniors seeking job leads. We

would appredate your making job
openings known to us. Phone

(919) 630-7150.

applications. JOB HUNT prints mailing
and return address labels too, saving a lot
of time and researching effort!

JOBHUNT runs on all IBM/Compat­
ible computers, uses only 256 RAM and a
single floppy disk drive, and is extremely
easy to use. Both sized disks are included.

It retails for $49.95 but is on sale for

$45 through the month of April in the
Methodist College Bookstore. One free
update is included in the purchase price.

JOBHUNT (fM) by Scope interna­
tional, is a computer program that helps
job-seekers find jobs. It is currently
available at 10 percent discount from the
Methodist College Bookstore.

A successful job search depends heavily
on the law of averages. The more
applications you can send and the better
you can target them, the higher your
chances of landing the right job. This is
where JOBHUNT Software can help!

It gives you the names, addresses,
phone/fax numbers and brief company
profiles ofleading potential employers
nationwide. You can search and display
by region and/or job function.

Then, you can type a sample cover
letter (or follow-up letter, or any other
letter) into JOBHUNT's built-in word
processor, then automatically and quickly
mail-merge it with the addresses you
select, to print personalized letters to the
employers.

Just attach resumes and you are ready
for a targeted mass mailing of your job

Many who attended Homecoming last
fall were acutely aware of the absence of

• Joanna Cherry Palumbo '69.
In recent years, Joanna has done a

masterful job of persuading her classmates
and acquaintances from other classes to
return to Methodist for class reunions.

In reaction to her absence this year,
John Brown '71, an attorney in Chesa­
peake, Virginia, sent Joanna a six-page
notice last November detailing a class
action suit against her on behalf of
members of the Class of '71.

In his motion for judgment, Brown
seeks compensatory damages for the
emotional distress suffered by his clients:
Gay and Ed Will­
iams, Bill and Jackie
Estes, Dave
Woodard, Camille
Sizemore, Les
Kaunitz, Steve
Harden, Bobby
Hodges, Al Pierce,
Tom and Sharon

Sanders, Johnny
Lipscomb, et. al.
The complaint states AJOANNA CHERRY

Andreas Wmsmn, sales representative for The Image
Men of Fayetteville, recently won Best Of Show
in the ADDY Awards competition sponsored by
the Fayetteville Area Advenising Federation. He
won the award for his graphic design of an
annual repon for the Cumberland County Public
Libraty.

CLASS OF 1986

Amy Wallace recently changed jobs and is now
working as a kinderganen teacher for Southwest
Elementaty - Lexington, NC.

Paige Thome married Dr. Richard W. Walker, July
13, 1991 at Hay Street United Methodist
Church, Fayetteville.

Wendy Carroll Skinner received her master's degree
in elementaty education from East Carolina
University in December. She is currently
teaching kinderganen in Wilson County.

CLASS OF 1989

CLASS OF 1988

Michael Johnson is now a forestty technician with
the Fon Bragg forestty branch of the Environ­
mental and N aturalRcsources Division.

Kathy Tatum is engaged to William D. "Buz"
McPhail of Fayetteville. The wedding is planned
for Dec. 31 at Snyder Memorial Baptist Church.
Kathy is employed as a safety director with the
City of Fayetteville.

CLASS OF 1990

CLASS OF 1991
Cheryl Ann Schroeder and Leighton Alan Thomas

were married on Dee 15, 1991. Cheryl received a
job with Johns Hopkins University in Baltimore,
MD as a data research assistant. She plans to
attend Hopkins in the summer for a master's
degree in business with a concentration in
information systems. Leighton is an Assistant
Golf Professional at Wakefield Golf Gub in

Westminster. MD, where the couple currently
resides.

Lt. Patrick L Beatty, wife Jane Beatty and their
daughter Rachel were assigned to the 105th
Finance Suppon Unit. Augsburg, Germany. Lt.
Beatty will be working for the 105th as a finance
officer.

Leigh Stutts has been named cUstomer service
manager at Cross Creek Mall. She will manage
the mall's customer service center scheduled to

open this spring.

Mark Powell is now managing editor of a weekly
newspaper devoted to covering agriculture­
The Deimllrvll Fllmtn". Recently Mark took first
place honors in the Matyland-Delaware-D.C.

Press Associations's 1991-92 competition for"weekly columns. " He also won third place for a
series on rural health care issues. His newspaper
was chosen by the Russian embassy's agriculture
attache to form a pannership with Flinner's

RussilZ, the latgest circulation agriculturenewspaper in the Russian republic.
Grace Alvina Mock Haney has moved from Panama,

CA to Silver Creek, GA. Her husband, CSM
(Rct.) Eric Haney, received the Purple Hean
during Operation Just Cause. The Haneys are
hoping to return to the Fayetteville area in the
near future.
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CAMPUS CALENDAR
April
3-5
4

9

11

14
20
21
22

25

26
26
28
30

May
2

10-17
11
12
14
15-16
17

22-23
24
30
31
31-June 5
June
10-13
14-18
14-19
15-19
22-26
22-27
22-27

28-July2
July
1-2
10-12
13-18
16-19
19-23
20-25
22-25

August
26-August 1
6-9

Two One-Act Farces By Anton Chekov, Mallett-Rogers House, Friday and Saturday at 8:00 p.m., Sunday at 3:00 p.m.
Little Miss Fayetteville Pageant, Reeves Auditorium, 7:00 p.m.
Emmaus Walk, T-239, 9:30 a.m.-3:00 p.m.
Pilot Club, Alumni Dinning room, 6:30 p.m.
Hail Dionysus, Theatre Festival, Reeves Auditorium, 7 p.m.
Emmaus Walk, T-239, T-240, 9:30 a.m.-3:00 p.m.
Women's Alumni Soccer Game, time TBA. Phone 630-7096 for more information.
Foundation Luncheon, Alumni Dining Room, 12:30 p.m.
Cape Fear Amateur Radio Society, Alumni Dining Room, 7:00 p.m.
Methodist College Stage Band Concert, Reeves Auditorium, 8:00 p.m.
Awards Convocation, Reeves Auditorium, 1:00 p.m.
Fayetteville Piano Teachers' Association, Reeves Auditorium.
Emmaus Walk, Women's Division, T-239, T-240.
Men's Alumni Soccer Game, time TBA. Phone 630-7097 for more information.

Denise Darby's Art Show, Mallett-Rogers House (art show open for viewing till May 3).
Methodist College Chorus Concert, Reeves Auditorium, 3:00 p.m.
Community Concerts, Reeves Auditorium, 8:00 p.m.
Stock Market Symposium. Main Dining Room, Student Union, 6:30 p.m.

College Lakes Baptist Church, Mother/Daughter Banquet, Alumni Dining Room, 5:00 p.m.
Cumberland County Youth Orchestra, Reeves Auditorium, 8:00 a.m.
Fayetteville Symphony Orchestra, Reeves Auditorium, 8:00 p.m.
Jennifer Bell's Art Show, Mallett-Rogers House.
Cape Fear Amateur Radio Society, Alumni Dining Room, 7:00 p.m.
Foundation Luncheon, Alumni Dining Room. 12:30 p.m.
Pilot Club, Alumni Dining Room, 6:30 p.m.
Cheerleading Camp, Cheer Ltd.
Baccalaureate, Reeves Auditorium, 10:30 a.m.

Graduation, Reeves Auditorium, 2:00 p.m.
Ann Clark School of Dance, Reeves Auditorium.

Guy Elementaty School Graduation.
Pageant Sponsored by the American Business Women's Association, Reeves Auditorium.
Performing Arts Program Recital, Reeves Auditorium, 2:30 p.m.
Golf Retreat for United Methodist Women.

Notth Carolina Annual Conference of The United Methodist Church.

Notth Carolina Conference Music Workshop.
Youth Golf Camp.
Soccer Day Camp.
Soccer Team Camp.
Pentecostal Youth Camp.
Methodist College Volleyball Camp.
Cumberland County Schools' Sports Camp.

N.C. Under-16 Women's State Select Soccer Team.

New student and family orientation.
Cheerleading Camp.
Region III Mini-Region Soccer Camp.
Gids' Basketball Camp.
Methodist College Music Camp.
Region III-U-16 ODP Soccer Team.

Annual Conference Session of The United Methodist Youth Fellowship.
Conference Summer School.

Calendar is subject to change.
For further information about a particular event, phone 630-7004.


